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Prayer to remove the false ark of the covenant from our humanity 
 

There are two kingdoms that we can reside under. There is the Kingdom of YHVH, which 
is the Kingdom of Light. If we are positioned under this Kingdom the Law of the spirit of 
Life pertains to us. We are then bondservants of YHVH, serving Him in righteousness and 
justice. Over this kingdom is the ark of the covenant, with the mercy seat which is a 
symbol not only of our Father’s heart, but also of us being able to trust in, lean on and 
rely upon Him.  
 
But, parts of us can also reside under the kingdom of Lucifer, which is the kingdom of 
death and destruction. If we are positioned under this kingdom the law of sin and death 
pertains to us. Here, we are not servants, but slaves. Under this dark kingdom Lucifer 
controls us like puppets from the control center which is the false ark of the covenant. 
Under this kingdom we carry a very heavy yoke of own power and strength. In this 
kingdom we have to strive and life is a struggle.  
 
As I started studying the Word to write this prayer, Holy Spirit said I had to look for the 
false horns of strength in our bodies. I immediately understood what this meant because 
one of the features of the true Ark of the Covenant is the horns of strength placed on its 
corners. Math 11:30 For My yoke is wholesome (useful, good – not harsh, hard sharp, or 
pressing, but comfortable, gracious, and pleasant and My burden is light and easy to be 
borne. After a google search I found the inverted horns of strength in our shoulders and I 
understood that we would have to give up our own strength if we want to come under 
the government of His ark of the covenant of mercy and strength.  
 

 
In this picture the horns of our strength are seen 
as our shoulder blades. The Word says the 
government is on His shoulders, but under 
Lucifer’s control we struggle to uphold a world 
of heart ache and sorrow.  
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Father, I come before You in the name of Yeshua and through the blood of the Lamb. 
Today, I sing Your praises as a faithful Father, who loves His children who reveals His 
glory and Kingdom within us. Thank You for intimacy, thank You for teaching us and 
thank You for victory – Your name is victorious and above every other name. Father, 
today we want to pray about the false Ark of the covenant in our brains and spirit heart. 
But, as we do this we pray and ask that all of our humanity will be placed under the 
blood of the Lamb.  
 
We ask that Your presence and Name will be a strong tower to us as we pray so that 
there will be no reprisal or back lash in the spirit because of what we stand for 
generationally for our seed lines and blood lines. So, as we pray, we ask to be shielded 
and protected in the spirit, hidden from any and all observation methods and devices 
from the kingdom of darkness and their workers. 
 
Father, I start today by repenting, taking full responsibility for the false ark of the 
covenant which has replaced Your ark of the covenant inside of us – and specifically the 
location thereof in our brains. I acknowledge before Your throne that this is a false altar, 
a false seat of dominion and a place from which the enemy rules from the inside. I 
present the structure and its symbolism before You as well as its effect on our spirits, 
souls and bodies in our seed line and blood line in all time, space and dimension. 
 
Father, I bring before You, the false ark as a symbol of false worship, false service, 
false religion, false fire, false light, false callings and false mantels. We repent and take 
full responsibility for the false ark of the covenant that is inside of us. We repent of our 
free will choice to depart from Your presence, to no longer seek and worship You in 
spirit and truth in the true ark of the covenant but, to seek after other gods, obeying, 
trusting and relying upon them and thereby establishing and welcoming in the 
counterfeit ark of the covenant. We repent of the dominion of the dark kingdom that was 
established in this way over our blood lines and seed lines. We repent and take full 
responsibility for the false worship and offerings that was brought to this altar in our 
spirit, souls and bodies. We repent that our hearts and minds are wired according to the 
principles, laws and instructions of this false/dark ark of the covenant. We repent for the 
positions we have taken up as priests of the kingdom of darkness rather than priests in 
the kingdom of Light. We repent that we are representatives of the false generational 
line of Levitical priests. We willingly denounce and renounce this dark priesthood – 
giving up all that it entails in our seed line and blood line. We repent and take full 
responsibility for our roles as Judas in the spirit. We repent for being traitors to the 
kingdom of light and truth and for trading this for lies and falsity. We willingly denounce 
and renounce our Judas character in the spirit. We repent of the worship of destruction, 
killing, destroying and steeling we have operated in, in our generational as well as blood 
and seed lines. Father, we repent of the human sacrifices we have brought on the altar 
of the false ark of the covenant through our hatred, bitterness, slander and gossip over 
people - killing and destroying their humanity for our gain and purpose. We take full 
responsibility and repent for every instance where we have harvested Your glory in 
other’s by hurting them, offering them up and killing them in the spirit through our deeds, 
words and thoughts and then placing these on the altar of the false ark as a sacrifice. 
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We repent where we have also done this to ourselves by our self-hatred, our feelings of 
worthlessness and self-destruction, our agreements with the kingdom of darkness and 
the rejection of Your design of us. Please forgive us for every instance where we have 
sacrificed others onto these dark altars. We ask that all the worship and blood on these 
altars will be silenced in all time, space and dimension through the blood of the Lamb. 
We ask that all parts of our humanity will be returned to us so that we can offer 
ourselves as living sacrifices unto You. We ask in the name of Yeshua that we will be 
cut loose from all dark Levitical priests and Judas's in our seed lines and blood lines in 
operation in all time, space and dimension.  
 
Father, where parts of our humanity were placed on this dark ark of the covenant alter 
through, rituals, agreements, covenants, vows, blood ties or any other applicable but not 
specifically mentioned we ask that they will be stopped, declared null and void and 
stripped of their power. We ask in the name of Yeshua that all the circles of witchcraft 
pertaining to us as well as their utterances will be broken in the name of Yeshua and 
silenced through the blood of the Lamb. We ask for a release of our humanity from any 
and all spheres, regions, altars or copies of the ark in all time, space and dimension. 
Please cut us loose! We ask that all of our humanity will be able to enter into Your 
presence with Your true ark of the covenant.  
 
We repent of every false covenant that has established this counterfeit ark of the 
covenant to be established in us. As we have prayed for the annulment of dark 
covenants in us, we also ask today that the symbol of these covenants as represented 
by the false ark of the covenant(s) will today, be utterly destroyed inside of us. Father, 
we declare that the rebuilding of the false ark of the covenant into our seed lines and 
blood lines is prohibited. The ground on which the true ark of the covenant will be 
rebuild and restored in us is marked by and sealed off by the blood of the Lamb. It has 
been paid for in full. 
 
Father, we repent and take full responsibility for the replacing of Your godly Cherubim 
that guards and protects the mercy seat, with dark entities. We repent for the legal right 
that has allowed this replacement of Your Kingdom order. We strongly denounce and 
renounce every covenant, agreement, assignment, vow and legal right that has allowed 
this to happen in the spirit. We ask today, by our free will choice, that all dark 
despotisms, powers, master spirits, world rulers, principalities and gods as well as any 
other applicable but not specifically mentioned including all human spirits associated 
with this false ark of the covenant and their kingdom dominion will be removed through 
our covenant with the Lamb of God from our humanity and specifically our brains. 
Father, I ask in the name of Yeshua, that all parts of us that are attached to the false ark 
of the covenant in whichever way will be removed, separated and released from their 
duties so as to be able to be restored in our position as high priests to Your ark of the 
covenant. 
 
We willfully give up these rankings, positions, authorities that are associated with the 
false ark of the covenant. 
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Father we repent and take full responsibility where our thoughts, deeds and words, our 
sins, transgressions and iniquities have caused the handing over of the ark of the 
covenant to the enemy and is therefore in captivity there. Father we see this has 
happened in scripture in Ps 78 and we repent for our hand in this. Please forgive us. We 
ask that in the Name of Yeshua and through the blood of the Lamb – by our repentance 
we humble our hearts before You and pray that Your ark of the covenant will be 
released from its captivity and will be restored to us.  
 
We repent of not wanting Your ark and your presence and allowing and wanting the 
false ark to be established in us. Father, we repent that we have for generations in our 
seed lines and blood lines stood underneath the false coverings of the kingdom of 
darkness also represented here by the false cloud of kingly presence. We ask in the 
name of Yeshua that all of our humanity will be removed from this false demonic cloud 
and all other demonic coverings associated with the false ark of the covenant including 
every word, chant, incantation, hex, vex, spell or curse that is uttered over our humanity 
and still in operation over our seed lines and blood lines. We willingly renounce and 
denounce these through the blood of the Lamb. Father, I ask in the name of Yeshua 
that all dark dominion over our spirit, souls and bodies will be cut off as well as the 
manifestations of the rituals we are subjected to in the spirit. Please reroute the brain 
pathways to no longer follow the paths, of stress, fear, anxiety, anger, bitterness and 
hatred that we were programmed with, in order to service this dark altar of the ark of the 
covenant as well as their associated manifestations / worship of death rituals including 
suicide, depression, epilepsy and all others. 
 
Father, in the name of Yeshua I also thank You that every veil that is still in place 
hindering any parts of our humanity to enter into your presence will be removed through 
the power of the cross and the blood of the Lamb. Father, I thank You that any and all 
such veils and associated devices and spiritual presences in our brains and humanity 
that hinders our functionality in the fullness of dominion and intimacy as well as 
righteousness and justice as service in Your ark of the covenant will be removed 
permanently from us without any reprisal in the spirit, I ask in the name of Yeshua that 
You will personally oversee this process.  
 
 
False manna - true manna 
We repent of all the false manna that we have eaten – the false provision that we 
adhered to and have become accustomed to with the false ark of the covenant. We 
repent of being self-sufficient. We repent of complaining and murmuring and not being 
satisfied with your provision and care for us. Please forgive us our longing for Egypt – 
even in the midst of Your presence. Today, we give up our citizenship of the kingdom 
and dominion of Egypt – in all itss forms and representations. Please forgive us our 
rebellion and discontented pleasure-seeking hearts and minds. Today, we choose to eat 
from the bread of life which is Yeshua. We therefore declare this to be our spiritual food 
in the name of Yeshua and we thank You for purging and cleansing our appetites, 
through the blood of the Lamb, so that we no longer seek after the false manna of the 
world and the dark kingdom. 
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Joh 6:32-35 Jesus then said to them, I assure you, most solemnly I tell you, Moses did 
not give you the Bread from heaven [what Moses gave you was not the Bread from 
heaven], but it is My Father Who gives you the true heavenly Bread. For the Bread of 
God is He Who comes down out of heaven and gives life to the world. Then they said to 
Him, Lord, give us this bread always (all the time)! Jesus replied, I am the Bread of Life. 
He who comes to Me will never be hungry, and he who believes in and cleaves to and 
trusts in and relies on Me will never thirst any more (at any time). 
 
48-50 I am the Bread of Life [that gives life--the Living Bread]. Your forefathers ate the 
manna in the wilderness, and [yet] they died. [But] this is the Bread that comes down 
from heaven, so that [any]one may eat of it and never die. 
 
We receive this thank you my King! Thank You for setting a table for us, for preparing 
this feast for us. We willingly and joyfully partake of this. 
 
False rod – true rod 
Father, we repent for adhering to the false rod of authority in the spirit associated with 
the dark ark of the covenant. We repent for seeking to be in charge, for wanting to be 
the boss, for wanting others to bow to us. We repent for our lack of submission. We 
willingly give up our positions of authority in the bloodline and seed line associated with 
the dark ark of the covenant. And today, we surrender our humanity to You, Yeshua, as 
high priest of the kingdom of light in the ark of the covenant. 
 
Father, I ask that Your Spirit will minister to our human spirits which were defiled, 
confused and held captive because of the service we entered into in the false ark of the 
covenant. Please restore our prophet, teacher, servant, giver, exhorter, ruler and mercy 
portions to their authority and positions of worship in Your ark of the covenant. Please 
wash away their sins, transgressions and iniquities generationally that has bound my 
human spirit to this false, dark service in the dark ark of the covenant. Please release 
my human spirit from the dark ark of the covenant and reinstate me to service in your 
ark of the covenant. I thereby, today renounce the dark priestly line of Eli, where their 
sins and transgressions has caused the presence of the Lord to depart from their seed 
line and blood line and ask today by Your mercy and kindness to be reinstated into the 
order of Malchezideck. 
 
False instructions – true instructions 
Father, today we ask for a reinstatement of Your instructions as portrayed by the ten 
commandments inside of the ark of the covenant in our brains and spirit hearts. We 
pray Your word as given in Col 3:16 Let the word [spoken by] Christ (the Messiah) have 
its home [in our hearts and minds] and dwell in us in [all its] richness and we thank You 
and receive Your covenant as given in Heb 8:10 For this is the covenant that I will make 
with the house of Israel after those days, says the Lord: I will imprint My laws upon their 
minds, even upon their innermost thoughts and understanding, and engrave them upon 
their hearts; and I will be their God, and they shall be My people. 
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Father, I am asking for a resurrection miracle in our brains today – our spirit mind, soul 
mind and body mind that the devices causing the dullness will be removed from us, 
grant us to be able to see the truth, to know the truth and to be able to testify of the 
deliverance power of Your truth. (John 12:40). Grant us again the power of 
understanding, we pray. Father, today we choose to obey Your instructions. We thank 
You for the blood of the Lamb and the power of the Holy Spirit that enables us to do 
this. Please help, us Lord. We ask that the false instructions that has been written on 
our hearts and minds will be removed from us through the blood of the Lamb. We 
willingly surrender our hearts and minds to be inscribed by You! Teach us, Lord, in the 
ways that we should go. 
 
Father, I ask in the name of Yeshua and through Your bloodline that the communication 
between the right and left sides of our brains and bodies will be restored because of the 
blood of the Lamb on the mercy seat, blotting out all other bloods. I ask that we will be 
able to operate in both dominion and intimacy, in both power and love, in both 
righteousness and justice. Please remove from our brains any and all blockages, 
devices and please heal our injured scar tissue parts that hinder us from walking in 
dominion. 
 
 So, Father, I understand that these are in place because of the choices we have made 
generationally by serving the dark ark of the covenant, but today I stand on our 
covenant of healing and restoration in Yeshua as salvation and ask for a regenerative, 
resurrection miracle for our souls, spirits and bodies. 
 
We repent, that for generations we shunned the presence of Your ark – because we did 
not understand the implications and also were afraid for the responsibility it entails. But, 
today, like David dancing with all his might with much jubilance and expectation our 
spirit man invites the ark of the covenant back into its rightful place. We desire Your 
presence, inside of us, my King! We welcome You, and exalt You! And like all of Israel 
in 1Sa 4:5 we shout with a great shout so that the earth resounded because the ark of 
the covenant came into the camp.  
 
Father, today we dedicate our brains as the Holy of Holies – the inner room where the 
ark of the Covenant is welcomed and wanted. We ask that in the name of Yeshua, our 
humanity will be prepared for this purpose – dedicated and sanctified unto You. Today, 
we stand in agreement with your word in 1Ch 22:19 Now, (choosing) to set our minds 
and hearts to seek (inquire of and require as your vital necessity) the Lord your God. 
Arise and build the sanctuary of the Lord God, so that the ark of the covenant of the 
Lord and the holy vessels of God may be brought into the house built to the Name and 
renown of the Lord. 
 
Today, we ask You to go before us so as to enable us to take every thought captive into 
obedience of Yeshua. Father, we thank You for his promise in Your Word. We receive it 
and declare it as the standard over our brains and humanity:  
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Exo 25:22 There I will meet with you and, from above the mercy seat, from between the 
two cherubim that are upon the ark of the Testimony, I will speak intimately with you of 
all which I will give you in commandment to the Israelites. 
 
We choose today that Your ark will go before us – showing us the way – we declare and 
choose today to follow after You, to hook our spiritual senses after your direction and 
paths. We repent of every false journey and path that was formed in our brains because 
of following after the false ark of the covenant. 
 
We repent and take full responsibility for every instance where we have departed on our 
own journeys and battles without consulting, You and with leaving your ark – the symbol 
of Your presence behind. We repent of the rebellion in our hearts where we then blame 
you for getting hurt and defeated.  
 
Father, today, in the name of Yeshua we take up our commission as priests to bear the 
ark of the covenant to stand before You and to minister to You, blessing Your Holy 
name all the day long. We repent for neglecting and shunning this duty over 
generations. Today, we also take full responsibility and repent for the fact that we 
operated as high priest to the false gods portrayed and sitting upon the counterfeit ark 
of the covenant inside of us. 
 
Today, we accept Your command as given in Jos 3:3 Commanding the people: When 
you see the ark of the covenant of the Lord your God being borne by the Levitical 
priests, set out from where you are and follow it. Today, we take up Your ark 
representing of Your power, presence and covenant in us. We thank You that the ark of 
the covenant will pass over before us as we have to cross our spiritual and physical 
Jordan’s. We choose today to set our minds apart so as to be prepared for the taking up 
of the ark of the covenant. We thank You for the sanctifying blood of the Lamb who 
cleanses us from all sin, transgression and iniquity so that we will be worthy bearers of 
the ark. We thank You that the presence of Your ark enables us to stand firm and on dry 
ground until we have finished passing over the waters of the Jordan. We praise You and 
exalt Your name that the waters are cut off. We remember and look upon the memorial 
stones telling of Your power, goodness, grace and care in our generations! We service 
this altar today by rehearsing your wonders and giving an offering of praise. (Josh 3,4). 
We thank You that You will restore to us the 12 stones of Your perfect government on 
this altar. Today, we blow the trumpets of victory – preparing the way for our King for 
His dominion to be established inside of our humanity. 
 
We thank You and today celebrate the ark of the covenant as a symbol of your saving 
power over our enemies. We ask that Your ark will be permanently fixed inside of our 
humanity and specifically our brains as Your temple. We pray that it will be a symbol of 
your dwelling inside of us – as the Word says that Christ is the head over our bodies – 
therefore we ask for the placing of Your ark of the covenant inside of our brains as 
symbol of Your headship. 
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Father, we declare that any and all other gods still present in our brains and humanity 
will be humiliated by being forced to bow before Your presence just as it happened to 
Dagon. Father, we invite Your Shekinah Glory to be returned over the ark of the 
covenant. Father, we have prayed in the past for the false kundalini light, the false holy 
spirit fire to be removed from us, and therefore we ask Your glory and presence to take 
up residence in your rightful place again. Flood our humanity with Your light, we pray! 
Shine forth my King! Thank You that Yeshua is our representative of Light. We thank 
You that we can declare and agree with your Word as testimony in this regard: 
 
Jer 3:16 And it shall be that when you have multiplied and increased in the land in those 
days, says the Lord, they shall no more say, The ark of the covenant of the Lord. It shall 
not come to mind, nor shall they [seriously] remember it, nor shall they miss or visit it, 
nor shall it be repaired or made again [for instead of the ark, which represented God's 
presence, He will show Himself to be present throughout the city]. [Isa. 65:17; Rev. 
21:3, 22, 23.] 
 
Heb 9:4 It had the golden altar of incense and the ark (chest) of the covenant, covered 
over with wrought gold. This [ark] contained a golden jar which held the manna and the 
rod of Aaron that sprouted and the [two stone] slabs of the covenant [bearing the Ten 
Commandments]. [Exod. 16:32-34; 30:1-6; Num. 17:8-10.] Heb 9:12 He went once for 
all into the [Holy of] Holies [of heaven], not by virtue of the blood of goats and calves [by 
which to make reconciliation between God and man], but His own blood, having found 
and secured a complete redemption (an everlasting release for us). 
 
Heb 9:13-15 For if [the mere] sprinkling of unholy and defiled persons with blood of 
goats and bulls and with the ashes of a burnt heifer is sufficient for the purification of the 
body, [Lev.16:6, 16; Num. 19:9, 17, 18.] How much more surely shall the blood of 
Christ, Who by virtue of [His] eternal Spirit [His own preexistent divine personality] has 
offered Himself as an unblemished sacrifice to God, purify our consciences from dead 
works and lifeless observances to serve the [ever] living God? [Christ, the Messiah] is 
therefore the Negotiator and Mediator of an [entirely] new agreement (testament, 
covenant), so that those who are called and offered it may receive the fulfillment of the 
promised everlasting inheritance--since a death has taken place which rescues and 
delivers and redeems them from the transgressions committed under the [old] first 
agreement. 
 
Rev 11:19 Then the sanctuary of God in heaven was thrown open, and the ark of His 
covenant was seen standing inside in His sanctuary; and there were flashes of lightning, 
loud rumblings (blasts, mutterings), peals of thunder, an earthquake, and a terrific 
hailstorm. [I Kings 8:1-6.] 
 
We praise You and exalt You. 
In the name of Yeshua 
So be it!  
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